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Submitted By Submitted Date

Action Recommendation:

R resólution awarding Bid 14-41 to and authorizíng the purchase of bulk crushed rock salt from Central Salt, LLC for

a unit price of SfOe.f0 per ton, as needed, throughout the 2OL4-2O15 winter season.

Budget lmpact:

Transportation Services /

2L00.4L20.5204.00

' Account Number

Project Number

Budgeted ltem? Yes
'1'!ç#

Street

Fund

Project Title

Current Budget

Funds Obligated

s

S

74,865.00

73,408.45

Current Balance s 1,456.55

Does ¡tem have a cost?

Budget Adjustment Attached?

Item Cost

Budget Adjustment

Yes

No

s

s

Remaining Budget s 1,456.55

Comments: The "item cost" box has been left blank because the exact m cost will vary depending upon the

Transportation Division's fluctuating needs based on the

Þk 1t?'t/t'l
.P.* oL- lL1,^. 1' 2''7',,t! /7

Previous Ordinance or Resolution #

Original Contract Number: Approval Date:

A/rt/ilL TYYlf

winter weather season.
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CITY OFffik CITY COUNCIL AGENDA MEMO

MEETING OF AUGUST 5,2014

TO: Mayor and CitY Council

THRU: Don Marr, Chief of Staff

FROM: Terry Gulley, Transportation Services Director

DATE: July 17,2014

SUBJECT: Bid 14-41, Bulk Crushed Rock Salt' Rebid

RECOMMENDATION:
A resolution awarding Bid 14-41to and authorizing the purchase of bulk crushed rock salt from

Central Salt, LLC forã unit price of $106.16 per ton, as needed, throughoutthe 2014-2015

winter season.

BACKGROUND:
The purchase of bulk construction materials and services is necessary to maintain current

infrastructure and to implement projects outlined in the 2013-2017 Capital lmprovements
program and annual budget and work program. Sealed bids in accordance with State statutes,

City ordinances, and purchasing procedures were publicly read and the results are attached to

this memo.

DISCUSSION:
The only bid received for bulk crushed rock salt was submitted by Central Salt, LLC. Their
product meets all necessary specifications.

BUDGET/STAFF IMPAGT:
Funds for the acquisition of these materials have been budgeted in Street Fund. Bulk crushed

rock salt will be purchased on an "as needed" basis with payment remitted via procurement

card.

Attachments:
Bid 14-4l Tabulation
Bid Submittal

Mailing Address:
113 W. Mountain Street
Errratfar¡illo AA -127o1

www.f ayettevi I I e- a r. g ov
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RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION TO AWARD BID #14-41 AND AUTHORIZE THE

PURCHASE OF CRUSHED ROCK SALT FROM CENTRAL SALT

COMPANY IN THE AMOI-INT OF $106.16 PER TON, AS NEEDED

THROUGH JULY 3T,2OI5

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF

FAYETTEVILLE, ARKANSAS:

Section 1. That the City Council of the City of Fayetteville, Arkansas hereby awards Bid

#I4-41-*d u.rthorizes the purchase of crushed rock salt from Central Salt Company in the

amount of $ 106. I 6 per ton, as needed, through July 3 I , 2015 .

PASSED and APPROVED this 5th day of August,2014.

APPROVED: ATTEST:

By: By:
LIONELD JORDAN, Mayor SONDRA E. SMITH, City Clerk/Treasurer
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CITY OF

:¡..'::i.;i:ìT:: ..,rì

RKANS

Medium Crushed Clean Rock Salt for Snow and lce

Removal: Maximum size 3/8" with no more than 5%

exceeding size 3/8", meeting AHTD specifications -
DELIVERED to the City of Fayetteville, 1525 S.

Happy Hollow, Fayetteville, AR 72701- Through

July 31, 2015

1

Bid I 4-41, Bulk Grushed Rock Salt - Rebid

*NOTIGE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting minimum specifications and formal

GERTIFIED:

ÈÌi,,çl;i

Cargill

TOTAL BA,SE BID=

600

lU'el

$0.00

Centrail SaltLLC

rchasing Manager

$0.00

NO BID

$106.16

Independent

..Fdfç='..Fgli
;æirmnit;tri

$63,696.00

Bid:1441
DATE: 0711612014
3:00 PM
CITY OF FAYETTEVILLE

$63,696.00

1il?

$0.00

Þr¡dé;per,
:t-l!ìífidif!;l:!.ti

Morton

$0.00

NO BID

$0.00

Norlh American
Satf

|irÞFf¡t

$0.00

NO BID

;:ii:råta¡:tii
í#i:lil*ii:-#

$0.00

'l - tt'-
Date

$0.00

NO BID
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CITY O F

YCLLCV]
I ARKAN

City of Fayetteville, Arkansas
Purchasing Division - Room 306

113 W. Mountain
Fayetteville, AR72701.
Phone: 479.575.8220

TDD (Telecommunication Device for the Deafl:479.521.1315

DEADLINE: Wednesday, July L6,20L4 before 3:00 PM, LocalTime

rc
A5

INVITATION TO BID: Bid L4-4t, Bulk Crushed Rock Salt - Rebid

DELIVERY LOCATION: Room 306 - 113 W. Mountain, Fayetteville, AR 72701

PU RCHASI NG AGENT: And rea Foren, CP PO, CP P B, aforen @ favettevil le-a r. gov

DATE OF ISSUE AND ADVERTISEMENT: Saturday, June 28,2Ot4

INVITATION TO BID

Bid 14-41. Bulk Crushed RockSale - Rebid

No late bids will be acceoted. Bids shall be submitted in sealed envelopes labeled with the name and address of
the bidder.

All bids shall be submitted in accordance w¡th the attached City of Fayetteville specifications and bid documents
attached hereto. Each bidder is required to fill in every blank and shall supply all information requested; failure

to do so may be used as basis of rejection.

The undersigned hereby offers to furnish & deliver the articles or services as specified, at the prices & terms stated hereln, and ln
strict accordance with the specifications and general conditions of bidding, all of which are made a part of this offer. Ihis offer is not
subject to withdrawal unless upon mutual written agreement by the Proposer/Bidder and City Purchasing Manager. 

,

Name of Firm: Central Salt, LLC

Contact Person: Lori Younq Title: Customer Service Supervisor

E-Mail: lvounq@centralsalt.com Phone: 620-257-5626 Ext.2O3

Business Address: 385 Airport Road, Suite 108

City: Elsin State: lL Zip: 60123

Signatur Date: 711512014

Cíty of Fayetteville, AR

Bid744!, Bulk Crushed RockSalt - REBID

Page 1 of 15
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City of Fayetteville
gldt44;L Bulk Crushed RockSalt- Reb¡d

Bid Form

ITEM: DESCRIPTION: QUANTTY: *PRICE EACH: *TOTALPRICE

1. Medium Crushed Clean Rock Salt for Snow
and lce Removal: Maximum size 3/8'wíth no
more than 5% greater than 3/8" in the mix,
meeting AHTD specifications - DELIVERED to
the City of Fayetteville, 1525 S. Happy Hollow
Fayetteville, AR 72701 - Through July 31,
2015

600TonsS106.16563,696'00
*Salr producer: Gentral Salt / Lyp4q Mj4e

2. Medium Crushed Clean Rock Salt for Snow
and lce Removal: Maximum size 3/8'with no
more than 5% plus 3/8' in the mix, meeting
AHTD specifications - PICKED UP BY the City
of Fayetteville - Through July 31, 2015

200Tons S N/A S

*Salt Producer:

Please Specifu Location from ltem 2:

*Physical address of salt pick up location:

Address:

City: State: Zip Code:

TOTAL BASE BID (Sum of ltem l and ltem 2): S 63'696'00

Blds shall be submitted on this bid form in its entireÃt AND accomponied hv descriptive literature on the products

being bid. The City reserues the right to award thls bld based on the CiVs best interest at the tlme of product

order.

THIS BID FORM CONTINUES ON THE NEXT PAGE.

Cify of Fayetteville, AR

Bid 74-4I, Bulk Crushed Rock Salt - REBID

Page 2 of 15
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ÐGCUTION OF BID.

Actual specification of any deficient ltem shall be noted on the bld sheet or separate attachment. lf specif¡cations of item bld

d¡ffer from provided liteåture, deviaüon shall be documented and certified by the manufacturer as a regular production

option.

Upon signingthis Bi4 the bldder certifies that:' r. ue/ine has read and agrees to the reguirements set forth in this proposal, including specifications, terms,

standard condîtions, and any pert¡nent information regarding the articles being bid on.

Z. Unless otherwise noted and explaíned, the unit bid and listed meets or exceeds all of these requirements as

specified by The Gty of Fayetteville'

3. The Bidder can and wilt comply with all specifications and requirements for delivery documentat¡on and support

as specified herein'

4. l, as an officer of thls organization, or per the attached letter of author¡zat¡on, am duly authorized to certiñ/ the

information provided herein is accurate and true.

S. Bidder shall comply with all State and Federal Equal Opportunity and Non-Discriminat¡on requ¡rements and

conditions of employrnent in addition to all federal, state, and local laws.

6, Bidder shall disclose any possible conflict of interest with the City of Fayetteville, including but not limited to, any

relationship with any CiÇ of Fayetteville employee. Response shall disclose if a known relationship exists

between any principal or employee of your firm and any city of Fayetteville employee or elected city of

Fayettevllle official. lf no relationship exists, this should also be stated in your response. Failure to disclose such a

relatlonship may resutt in cancellation of a purchase and/or contract as a result of your response.

X L.) NO KNOWN RELATIONSHIP EXISTS

2.) RE|ATIONSHIP EXISTS (Please explain):

Bidder will perform the Work in compliance with all applicable trench safety standards set forth ¡n occupational

safety and Health Administration (osHA) Part 1926 - subpart P - Excavations.

As A bidder on this project, you are required to provide debarmenVsuspension certification indicating that you

are in compliance with the below Federal Executive order. Certification can be done by completing and signing

this form.

a. Federal Executive Order (E.O.) 12549 "Debarment and Suspension" requires that all contractors receiving

individual awards, using federal funds, and all sub-recipients cert¡ñ/ that the organization and its

principals are not debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily

excluded by any Federal department or agency from doing business with the Federal Government'

b. your signature below certifles that neither you nor your principal is presently debarred, suspended,

proporãd for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from participation in this transaction

by any federal department or agency'

City of Fayetteville, AR

B¡d 14-41, Bulk Crushed Rock Salt - REBID

Page 3 of 15
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8.
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Unsigned bids wlll be rejected. ltems marked t are mandatory fur consideration.

*MMEOFFIRM: Central Salt, LLC

*DlBl 

^or 
Corporation Name

Purchdse Order/Powents shall be issued to this ndme
CentralSalt, LLC

'¡BUSINESSADDRESS: PO Box 798309

*CtTy: St.Louis *SrATE: MO *ZlP: 63179-8000

*pHoNE: 620-257-5626 Ext.203 Fî,ü: 620-257-5052

*E-MA¡L: lyoung@centralsalt.com

*BY: (PRINTED NAME) LOT| YOUNO

*AUT}IORIZED

TT¡TLE: CustomerService Superuios¡

DUNS NUMBER: CAGE NUMBER:

*TAX lD NUMBER: 43-1788697

Acknowledge Addendums:

Addendum No. 1 Dated:

Addendum No. Dated:

5t19t14 Acknowledged by: Lori Young

Addendum No.

Addendum No.

Dated:

Dated:

Acknowledged by:

Acknowledged by:

Acknowledged by:

City of Fayetteville, AR

Bid 74-4L, Bulk Crushed Rock Salt - REBID

Page 4 of 1.5
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CITY OF

lläliÄil

RKA

lMedium Crushed Clean Rock Salt for Snow and lce
Removal: Maúmum size 3/8" w¡th no more than 5%
exceeding size 3/8", meeting AHTD specifications -
DELIVERED to the City of Fayettevilþ, 1525 S.
Happy Hollow, Fayetteville, AR 72701 - Through

July31,2015

1

N AS Bid 14-41, Bulk Grushed Rock Salt - Rebid

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting minimum specifications and formal

Éèi;1ilöni
lï"-giii-ii:ii;.,Xtir*

rPriôé-Pëî
at- ii ll- .:if rl j Lìi -'1: ,

r'!¡.1irl,Oflîirüiil

Cargíll

TOTAL BASE BID=

600

I u,el
P. Vice, Purchasing Manager

$0.00

, Central SaltLLC

$0.00

NO BID

$106.16

Independent

$63,696.00

Bid:1441
DATE: OT11612014
3:00 PM
CITY OF FAYETTEVILLE

$63.696.00

$0.00

Mgrton

?r¡ëê,Perl

tlu.îitt_n:¡.i¡+i

$0.00

NO BID

r r.. i.. ¡ .r .:i-:. . . ..

::;.;;T-oiâiri,i;l;;
jirüii.í,i*j.+,1l.íÍ ¡

$0.00

Nofth American
Satú

PÍ¡eþ:.Fler,
,i:j;¡i¡ií'i#¡*

$0.00

NO BID

. ::.:i.:.ir:.i , ¡: .

.;i,j.ifôtall ij;i
f ¿:;ilrl.:':i'.ar:.i;i:i

$0.00 $0.00

NO BID
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