
City of Fayetteville ltem Review Form

2014-0027
@

February 4,2014
City Council Meeting Date - Agenda ltem Only
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Terry Gulley Transportation Services
Submitted By Department

Action Required:

A resolution awarding Bid #14-12 and authorizing the purchase of drainage pipe for varying unit
prices and from various vendors as shown on the attached bid tabulation and authorizing the use of
other bidders based on price and availability, as needed through the end of calendar year 2014.

Does this item have a cost? ]y"t-l

Cost of this request

Account Number

Project Number

Budseted rt"rz @]

Category or Project Budget

Funds Used to Date

$o.oo
Rernaining Balance

Budget Adjustment Attached?

Various Capital Projects
Program or Project Name

Transportation I mprovements

Program or Project Category

Sales Tax Capital lmprovements

Fund Name

vÐ7308t2-

01-1'7-i 4?'l?:5? RCV"
Previous Ordinance or Resolution #

Original Contract Number:

Comments:

'-PJ q-- [L-L-
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THE CITY OF FAYETTEVILLE, ARKANSAS

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA MEMO

To: Mayor and City Council

Thru: Don Marr, Chief of Staff

From: Terry Gulley, Transportation Services Director

Date: February 4,2014

Subject: Bid#14-12, Drainage Pipe

PROPOSAL:

A resolution awarding Bid #14-12 and authorizing the purchase of drainage pipe for varying unit prices and
from various vendors as shown on the attached bid tabulation and authorizing the use of other bidders based on
price and availability, as needed through the end of calendar year 20T4.

RECOMMENDATION:

The purchase of bulk construction materials and services is necessary to maintain current infrastructure and to
implement projects outlined in the 2013-2017 Capital Improvements Program and annual budget and work
program. Sealed bids in accordance with State statutes, City ordinances, and purchasing procedures were
publicly read and the results are attached to this memo.

BUDGET IMPACT:

Funds for the acquisition of materials and services have been budgeted in various capital projects within the
Sales Tax Capital Improvements Fund and Street Fund operating programs.

Telecommunications Device for the Deaf fDD @791 52i -1 31 6 113 West Mountain - Fayetteville, AR72701
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RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION TO AWARD BTD #14-12 TO HANSON PIPE & PRECAST

AND SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE OF

DRAINAGE PIPE FOR VARYING TJNIT PRICES AND AUTHORIZING THE

USE OF OTHER BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE AND AVAILABILITY AS

NEEDEDTHROUGHTHEENDoFCALENDARYEAR2014

BEITRESOLVEDBYTHECITYCOUNCILoFTHECITYoF
FAYETTEVILLE, ARKANSAS:

Section l: That the City Council of the City of Fayetteville, Arkansas hereby awards Bid

#14-12 to Hanson pip. ¿ pråcast and Scurlock Industiies for the purchase of drain pipe at

varying prices as set fårth in the certified bid sheet, a copy of which is attached as Exhibit "A'"

Section 2: That the City Council of the City of Fayetteville, Arkansas hereby authorizes

the use of other bidders based on price and availatility as needed through the end of calendar

year 2014.

PASSED and APPROVED this 4th day of February'2014'

APPROVED:

LIONELD JORDAN, MaYor

ATTEST:

soÑun¡, E. SMITH, City Clerk/Treasurer
By: By:
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Item f

1

2

Size

3

4

15

5

ARKANSA

Measure

18u

6

24"

D

J0'

ãt

I

D

meter

36"

9

D

meter

42"

10

D

meter

4ó

tt

Diameter
meter

15"

t2

D¡ameter

18"

13

utameter

24"

Diameter

L4

Circular Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class lll

30u

Diameter

15

Circular Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class

36"

t6,

Diameter

Circular Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class

42"

L7

Diameter

Circular Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class

48"

B¡d 1 4-12, Drainage Pipe

Description

18

Diameter

Circular Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class

42'

Flared End Section, Circular Reinforced Concrete, Class I

19

Diameter

Circular Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class lll

48"

Flared End Section, Circular Reinforced Concrete, Class I

Diameter

20

6 Feet

C¡rcular Re¡nforced Concrete P¡pe, Class

Flared End Section, Circular Reinforced Concrete, Class tl

D

5 Feet

ameter

Flared End Section, Circular Reinforced Concrete, Class ll

Diameter

4 Feet

Flared End Section, Circular Reinforced Concrete, Class ll

,.,,,,':'.,..t :,:..: :: r'.:t.. : .' :

l,'i'',. ltid¡cât¿è gid'correctioä

CERTIFIED:

4 Feet

Feet

Flared End Section, Circular Reinforced Concrete, Class lll

Feet

Flared End Sect¡on, Circular Reinforced Concrete, Class lll

Feet

Feet

ll

Flared End Section, Plastic Pipe

Estimated

Quant¡ty

Flared End Section, Plastic Pipe

Box Culvert. 6 ft. Sections (6x7)

Box Culvert. 5 ft. Sections (3x1

Junction Box. 4 ft. Sections l4x4x4l

il

90

Unit of
Measure

180

lnlet Box, 4 ft. Sections (4x4x4\

180

45

Feet

45

Feet

Hanson Pipe & Precast

45

Feet

45

Feet

s 11.ss

¿

Feet

s 14.89

B,lÐ:'14-12
DATE:01/14114
TIME:2:00 PM

CITY OF FAYETTEVILLE

2

Feet

5 zs.se

2l

2

Feet

s 33.96

2

Eacn

S 46.76

S r,osg.so

2

Each

s s8.38

S 2,680.20

¿

Each

s 74.02

5 q,zqq.qo

¿

Each

S 289.44

s 1.s28.20

2

:5 . z;io+:zo

s 317.45

Eacn

Scurlock lndustries

2

s 360.30

Each

S 2,627.10

S lo.r.s

4

Eacn

s 3.330.90

s 400.98

s 72.2s

9

tacn

s 732.22

S 578.88

10

S tz.ts

Each

S goe.ss

S 634.90

s 26.2s

10

tach

s 1.140.73

s 720.60

S sg.ss

Each

s 968.ss

S 801.95

s 913.s0

S 49.7s

Tota

Each

s 1,140.73

s 1.464.44

s 2,20s.00

s 60.4s

s

s 1,937.10

Each

S 3.195.00

Bid Price =

s 236.00

2,808.00

S s,4oo.oo

s 2.28L.46

s 1,181.25

s 268.s0

5 t,tto.zs

s 1.937.10

S 336.00

NO BID

s 2,28t.46

5 2,238.75

5 397.00

NO BID

S 11,232.00

5 2,720.25

S 746.s0

s '48,600.00

S 472.oo

S 9s7.oo

5 537.00

s

S 1.132.00

S 672.00

s

S zg¿.oo

NO BID

,:Sgo,oz+.¿o

S 1,493.00

NO BID

s 1.800.00

s 1.914.00

$ 2,1s0.00

S 2,264.00

s 900.00

s e00.00

s

s 7.200.00

s L9,350.00

s 9.000.00

S g,ooo.oo

r$66,920¡50
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