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Action Required:

A resolution awarding Bid #14-09 and authorizing the purchase of plastic drainage pipe for varying
unit prices as shown on lines 27-38 of the attached bid tabulation and authorizing the use of other
bidders based on price and availability, as needed through the end of calendar year 2014.
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TH E CITY OF FAYETTEVILLE, ARKANSAS

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA MEMO

To:

Thru:

Mayor and City Council

Don Marr, Chief of Staff

From: Terry Gulley, Transportation ServicesDirector-lûþ

Date: January 7,2014

Subject: Bid#14-09, Drainage Pipe

FRoPosA!:

A resolution awarding Bid#14-09 and authorizingthe purchase of plastic drainage pipe for varying unit prices
as shown on lines 27-38 of the attached bid tabulation and authorizing the use of other bidders based on price
and availability, as needed through the end of calendar year 2014. No bids were received for concrete drainage
pipe, as shown on lines I-26 of the attached bid tabulation. Concrete drainage pipe will likely be re-bid in the

near future.

RECOMMENDATION:

The purchase of bulk construction materials and services is necessary to maintain current infrastrucfure and to
implement projects outlined in the 2013-2017 Capital Improvements Program and annual budget and work
program. Sealed bids in accordance with State statutes, City ordinances, and purchasing procedures were
publicly read and the results are attached to this memo.

BVDGET IMFAÇT:

Funds for the acquisition of materials and services have been budgeted in various capital projects within the
Sales Tax Capital Improvements Fund and Street Fund operating programs.

Telecommunications Deviceforthe Deaf TDD (479) 521-1316 I 13 West Mountain - Fayetteville, AR72701
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RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION AV/ARDING BID #T4-09 AND AUTHORIZING THE
PURCHASE OF DRAINAGE PIPE FOR VARYING LINIT PzuCES FROM
VARIOUS VENDORS, AS NEEDED THROUGH THE END OF CALENDAR
YEAR 2014

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
FAYETTEVILLE, ARKANSAS:

Section 1. That the City Council of the City of Fayetteville, Arkansas hereby awards Bid
#14-09 and authorizes the purchase of drainage pipe for varying unit prices from various
vendors, as shown in the attached Exhibit "A", as needed through the end of calendar year 2014.

PASSED and APPROVED this 7th day of January,2\IL.

APPROVED: ATTEST:

By:
LIONELD JORDAN, Mayor SONDRA E. SMITH, City Clerk/Treasurer

By:
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BID: l¿t 09
DAfÊ:12111113
TIME:2:00 PM
CITY OF FAYETTEV¡LLE

ARKANSAS B¡d 14-09, Drainage Pipe

ts' DhmÊt6r ChoularR€lnforc€d C¡næte P¡pe. Clasi lll 90 FeEl NO BID 5 NO BID s

2 Cìrolar Relnforced Conæte P¡pc, Cl6$ lll t80 Fset NO BID ù NO BID $

3 24" CirÐlr ReinfoEd Conrete P¡pe, Clas lll 180 F6êt NO BID ù NO BID ù

30" DiÊmêlêr Circdú Rohforced Concrcle P¡pÊ, ClEs lll 45 Feet NO BID $ NO BID ù

1 Dlañele¡ CiEdil Relnforced ConqelE P¡pE, Clâs lll ¿5 Feet NO BID $ NO BID ù

2 ârl C¡rdlal Re¡nforced conqele P¡pe, Clas lll á5 Feel NO BID ù NO BID Ð

3 4A' DIsñêþr CIrulü R€¡nlorcod Conwte P¡pe, Clas lll 45 Feêt NO BID ü NO BID Ð

4 r5" Flarcd End Secllon, Circ1¡larRslnfoGd ConcÞle, C¡Es lll 2 Each NO BID t NO BID $

5 ta" Flared End Sedien, cir@lsr Rslnfo@d Concrels, Clas lll 2 Each NO BIO ù NO 8ID ù

6 24' Diãmsl€r Fl8red End sodion, Cirqlõ ReinfoHd consote. Clas lll 2 NO BID ù NO BID ù

7 30" Dbmel FIEÉd End Sed¡on, Circulr Reinfor@d Conwte, Clas$ lll Fâ.¡ NO BID t NO BID I
I Di Flarcd End sectrbn. Cißular Relnforced Conæle. Chs lll Eâch NO BID Ð NO BID

I âttr Flarod End Sedion, CiHlar Roinfo@d Concrolq Cla$ lll 2 Eãch NO BID t NO BID

l0 D¡åmelet Flared End S€cl¡on, C¡mler Re¡nfored conçrqts, clas lll Fã.'h NO 8ID NO BID $

14ì'x23l' RIBê & Sðån Hodzontal EllipllHl Relnforæd CÐæte Pipe, Cless lll 90 Fe€t NO BID ù NO BID ù

7 1g'x 30' Rbè & SDan Ho¡izontal Ellþt¡61 Re¡nfor€d Cmmte P¡po, class lll s NO BID $ NO BID $

2 24'x3B' Rh6 & SoM Horizonlal EllÞtl€l R€info@d Cøcrele P¡pe, Clas lll âÊ Fêêl NO BID $ NO BID $

3 tq' a ¿4' Hodzontal Elllptl€l R€inforced C6øele Pipe, Clss lll 45 Féêt NO BID $ NO BID ù

4 Horizontal Ellipt¡el Relnforcsd Cm@to Pípo, Class lll 45 Fe6t NO BID ù NO BID ù

5 38' x 60" Ris & Sosn Horlænlgl Ellipl¡æl RBinfoed CÆnæte P¡pe, Class lll 45 Feet NO BID $ NO BID $

21 Èê & Sbil Tapsæd End Secl¡ol! HorizonlÊl Ell¡ptical RcP, clãss lll 2 Eæh NO BID t NO BID s

22 19' x 30" RÈa & Som Tapercd End Secl¡on, Horizonlal Ell¡pUcal RCP, Class lll ) Fæh NO BID $ NO BID s

23 t¿'v ag' Tapercd End Section, HorÍzonlal Ell¡plìql RCP, Class lll Eæh NO BID $ NO BID ù

u Tapored End sect'þn, Horizonl6l Ell¡plisl RCP. Class lll 2 Each NO BID $ NO 8ID ù

25 Rk ß Sôân TaÞeßd End Soction, Horizont8l Ell¡pü€l RCP, Class lll 2 Each NO BID $ NO BID ù

2Ê 38'x 60" Taper€d End Ssc't¡on, HorizonlEl Ell¡pli€l RCP, Class lll 2 Eech NO BID $ NO BID Ð

27 15" Plasllc PÞe 1m Fêal $ 5.48 $ 548.00 $ 5.61 $ 561.00

28 18" PlEstiq P¡po Stxt FÊet s 7.51 $ 3,755.00 s 7.69 $ 3,845.00

29 ,Á. Plast¡c Pþo 500 Fsel $ t2.94 6'470.00 s t3.25 ù 6,625.00

30 30" Plastic Pife 2ú Feot $ 18.58 3,716.00 '19.02 s 3,804.00

31 36" DIemÊhr Plesl¡c PiFe too Feet s 25.62 $ 2,562.OO I 26.24 0 2,624.OO

32 42" Plasllc Pipe 60 Feêl ü 33.55 $ 2,013.00 $ 34.37 ç 2,c6.2.20

33 4A¡ dâñets Plasl¡c Pipe 60 Fæt I 34.44 s 2,306.40 39.37 s 2,&2.20

34 l5' Fl8rcd End Sectiø, Plast¡c Pìpe 7 Each $ 90.45 $ 180.90 ù 92.(x) $ 184.00

35 a9l Flared End S€c1lon, Pl8sl¡c P¡pe 2 Each $ 121.50 $ 243.00 $ 123.00 $ 246.O0

3G 24" Dlãmsld Flarod End Soc,tion, Plasllc P¡pe 2 Fâ.fi $ 174.00 ü 348.00 $ l58.OO $ 316.00

37 30' Flered End S€c1ion, Plastic P¡pE t Fqêh ù s75.00 $ 750.00 $ 379.00 $ 758.00

38 36" Flarcd End Sodion, Plast¡c Pipe 2 Eech ù 400.(þ $ 800.00 $ 401.00 $ 802.00

39 ¿ul FlaEd End s€ction, Plasl¡c Pipa 2 Eech NO BIO $ NO BID

40 4A' O¡amebr Flared End Sec{¡on. Pleslic P¡pe 2 Eactr NO BID I NO BID $

Total B¡d Pr¡ce

CERTIFIED:
P. VICE, PURCHASING MANAGER

2-tü-t<

-\Jl*NOTIGE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting man¡mum specifications and formal authorization by City officials.
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