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... Action Required;
A resolutlon awardlng Bid #13 09 and authonzmg the purchase of drainage p|pe for varymg umt pnces as shown on the
attached bid tabulation, and authorizing the use of other bidders based on price and availability, as needed through the
end of calendar year 2013.
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THE CITY OF FAYETTEVILLE, ARKANSAS

www.accessfayetteville.org

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA MEMO
To: Mayor a'ndeity Council B

Thru: Don Marr, Chief of Staff
Terry Gulley, Transportation Services Director -7 ;A‘

From: John Nelson, Management Accounting Coordinator T
Date:  December 20, 2012

Subject: Bid #13-09, Drainage Pipe

PROPOSAL:

A resolution awarding Bid #13-09 and authorizing the purchase of drainage pipe for varying unit prices as
shown on the attached bid tabulation and authorizing the use of other bidders based on price and availability, as
needed through the end of calendar year 2013.

The purchase of bulk construction materials and services is necessary to maintain current infrastructure and to
implement projects outlined in the 2013-2017 Capital Improvements Program and annual budget and work
program. Sealed bids in accordance with State statutes, City ordinances, and purchasing procedures were
publicly read and the results are attached to this memo.

- BUDGET IMPACT:

Funds for the acquisition of materials and services have been budgeted in various capital projects within the
Sales Tax Capital Improvements Fund and Street Fund operating programs.

Telecommunications Device for the Deaf TDD (479) 521-1316 113 West Mountain - Fayetteville, AR 72701
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RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION AWARDING BID #13-09 AND AUTHORIZING THE
PURCHASE OF DRAINAGE PIPE FOR VARYING UNIT PRICES FROM
VARIOUS VENDORS, AS NEEDED THROUGH THE END OF CALENDAR
YEAR 2013

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
FAYETTEVILLE, ARKANSAS:

Section 1. That the City Council of the City of Fayetteville, Arkansas hereby awards Bid
#13-09 and authorizes the purchase of drainage pipe for varying unit prices from various
vendors, as shown in the attached Exhibit “A”, as needed through the end of calendar year 2013.

PASSED and APPROVED this 15" day of January, 2013.

APPROVED: ATTEST:

By:

: By:
LIONELD JORDAN, Mayor

SONDRA E.‘SMITH, City Clerk/Treasurer
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a e b Vl . . glla':E:;;OISAI:I':TTEVILLE
ARKANSAS Bid 13-09, Drainage Pipe

3 5, b 2
1 15 Dismetar Clrular Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class Il 20 Feet No Bid No Bld $  16151% 1453501  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 9658 868.50
2 18" Olometer Cireular Reinforced Concrele Pipe, Class Il 180 Feet No Bid No Bld $ 208318 3,749.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1160 | 2,088.00
3 24" Diamater Circular Reinforced Concrele Pipe, Class lll 180 Feet No Bid No Bid $ 3299 | § 5,938.20 No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bid $ 16801 § 3.042.00
30" Diameter Circular Reinforced Cancrele Pipe, Class Il 45 Fest No Bid No Bid $ 4750 | $ 2,137.50 NoBid No Bid No 8id No Bid $ 24951 % 1,122.75
1 36" Diamatar Circular Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class Il) 45 Feet No Bid No Bld $ 6540 | § 2,943.00 § No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3740 | $ 1,683.00
2 42" Diameter Ciscular Relnforced Concrete Pips, Class I} 45 Fest No Bid No Bid $ 7540 | § 8,393.00 -No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4725 8 2,126.25
3 48" Diameter Circular Relnforced Concrete Pipe, Class 1il 45 Feet No Bid No Bid 3 80.71 | $ 4,081.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 5740 | $ 2,583.00
4 15" Diametar Flared End Section, Circular Reinforced Concrete, Class tl 2 Each No Bid No Bid $ 36000 % 720.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld $ 22500 | $ 450.00
5 18" Diamoter Flared End Section, Cireular Relnforced Concrete, Class Il 2 Each No Bid No Bid $ 371.00(8 742.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 255.00 | § 510.00
5 24" Diameter | _Flared End Section, Circular Relnforced Concrate, Class I 2 Each No Bid No Bid $ 403.00($ 818.00] NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 32000 $ 640.00
7 30" Diameter Fiared End Section, Circular Relnforced Concrete, Class It 2 Each No Bid No Bid $ 456.00( % 912.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 37800 | $ 756.00
8 36" Diamater Flared End Section, Circular Reinforced Concrete, Class Il 2 Each No Bid No Bid $ 8320048 1,664.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 709.00 | $ 1,418.00
9 42" Diarnater Flared End Section, Circular Relnforced Concrete, Class I 2 Each No Bid No Bid $ 11010048 2,202.00 -No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 91000 | $ 1,820.00
0 48" | oOwmeter | Flared End Section, Ciroular Reinforced Goncrete, Ciass I 2 Each No Bid No Bld $ 1205008 250200} NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid $  107500]§ 2,150.00
14"'%23" | Riss & gpan | Horizontal Elliptical Relnfarced Concrete Pipe, Class It 90 Feet No Bld No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bld No Bid $ 22651 $ 2,038.50
1 19" x 30" | Rise 8 Span Horizontal Elliptical Reinfasced Concrete Pipe, Class 1l 90 Feet No 8id No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bld No Bid $ 24451 % 2,200.50
2 24" x 38" | Rise & Span Horizontal Elliptical Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class il 45 Feet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No 8id No Bid $ 34.35| § 1,545.75
3 | 29"x45"| misesspan | Horizontal Eliipical Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class i 45 Feet No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bld No Bid $ 50.70 | § 2,281.50
4 | 34"x58"| mweaspan |  Horizontal Elfiplical Reinforced Cancrete Pipe, Class Il 45 Fest |- NoBid No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 66.05| § 2,972.25
5 38" % 60" | Riso & Span Horizontal Efliptical Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class lll 45 Feet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BId No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 81.50 | $ 3,667.50
21 14°x 23" | Riso & Span Tapered End Section, Horizontal Ellipticat RCP, Class I 2 Each No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 31200 | § 624.00
22 | 19°x30" | RisesSpan | _ Tapered End Section, Horizontal Elliptical RCP, Class il 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bid No 8id $ 38400 | $ 728.00
23 | 24'x38" | misesspon | Taered End Seclion, Horizontal Eliptical RCP, Class i 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 468.00 | $ 936.00
24 29" x 45" | Rise & Span Tapered End Seclion, Horizontal Elliptical RCP, Class itl 2 £ach No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 624.00 | § 1,248.00
25, 34" x 63" | Rise 8 Span Tapered End Section, Horizontal Elliptical RCP, Class Ill 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld $ 780.00{ § 1,560.00
26 }38"x60" | Risoaspan | Tapered End Section, Horizontal Eflptical RCP, Class 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bid $ 910.00 | $ 1,820.00
27 15 Diamater Plastic Pipe 100 Feet $ 5.88 | $ 588.00 No Bid No Bid 3 575 % 575.00 | $ 5785 | $ 578.50 | § 570} 8 570.00
28 18" Diamater Plastic Pips 500 Feet |$ 7299 s 3,995.00 |  NoBid No Bid s 782|8 3910003 78878 3933.50 | s 870]§ 4,350.00
29 24 Diamater Plastic Pipe 500 Feet B 13611 $ 680500 |  Nogid " No Bid $ 1333 [ $ 6665003 13408 5 6,703.00 § 1485 7.425.00
30 30" Dismeter Plastic Pipe 200 Feet S 1966 | $ 3,932.00 No Bid No Bid $ 19.26 | § 3852.00) 8 19.365 | § 3,873.00] 3 2050 | § 4,100.00
31 36" Diamator Plaslic Pipe 400 Feet $ 26541 8 2,664.00 No Bid No Bid $ 26.00 1 % 2,600.00 | $ 26.144 | § 261440 $ 2885 | $ 2,886.00
32 42 Olameter Plastic Pipe 80 Feot $ 35751 8 2,145.00 No Bid No Bid $ 36.00| % 2,10000{ $ 35221 § 2,113.26 | 3950 (8 2,370.00
33 48" Diametar Plastic Pipe 80 Feet $ 40691 8 2,441.40 No Bid No Bid § 3987 | $ 239220 § 40.083 | $ 2.404.98 | $ 48.35 | § 2,801.00
34 15" Diametsr Fiared End Section, Plastic Pipe 2 Each $ 8292 § 165.84 No Bid No Bid $ 8300]$ - 166.00] % 83.822 | §. 167.64 No Bld No Bid
35 18" Diameter Flared £nd Section, Plastic Pipe 2 Each 8 111371 8 22274 No'Bid No Bid $ 11137 § 2227418 112590 § 225.18 No Bid No Bid
36 24" Diameter Flared End Section, Plastic Pipe 2 Each $ 14294 | 8 285.88 No Bid No Bld $ 143.00 | $ 286.00| $§ 144.506 | § 289.01 No Bid Na Bid
37 30" | Oiameter Flared End Seation, Plastic Pipe 2 Each | $§ 34756 | 8 695.12|  NoBid No Bld $ 347008 694.00| § 351369 | § 702.74 No Bid No Bid
38 38" Diameter Fiared End Section, Plastic Pipe 2 Each $ 368,00 | § 736.00 No Bld . No 8id S 368.00 | $ 736001 3720328 744.06 No Bid No Bid
39 42" - Diamster Fiared End Section, Plastic Pipe 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bld
40 48" Diamater Flared End Seclion, Plastic Pipe 2 Each No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bld
Total Bid Price = ' e S

*EXCPETION:
. Pipe noted as "soil tight" not
"water tight",

. / ’ s
CERTIFIED: ’ % /ﬁ%%m [27 /0?// aa
.FC}REN,/MC‘HASWG AGENT NESS ’ ' DATE

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting minimum specifications and formal authorization by City officials.






